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Works: "Ethics," "Theologico-Political Treatise"

Contributions: Spinoza developed a monist

philosophy, asserting that everything is a

manifestation of a single substance, which he

called 'God or Nature'. He also worked on ethics

and the nature of human beings.

MAIN IDEAS

Monism
Spinoza rejected the dualistic view of
Descartes and posited that there is only one
substance in the universe, which he called
'God or Nature'. Everything that exists is an
aspect of this single substance.

Pantheism
Spinoza's identification of God with nature
led him to pantheism, the belief that God is
not a transcendent creator but is identical
with the natural world. This was a radical
departure from traditional religious views of
the time.

Ethical Life through Knowledge
Spinoza believed that living an ethical life is
based on the pursuit of knowledge. By
understanding the universe, we align
ourselves with the rational order of nature,
leading to virtue and happiness.

Determinism
He argued that everything in nature,
including human behavior, is fully
determined by causal chains. Free will is an
illusion; however, we can achieve freedom
through understanding these causalities.

Conatus (Striving)
Spinoza introduced the concept of 'conatus',
which is the innate inclination of a thing to
continue to exist and enhance itself. This
self-preservation principle is fundamental to
his understanding of life and ethics.


